109TH CONGRESS REPORT
2d Session HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 109-494

MAKING EMERGENCY SUPPLEMENTAL APPROPRIATIONS
FOR THE FISCAL YEAR ENDING SEPTEMBER 30, 2006,
AND FOR OTHER PURPOSES

JUNE 8, 2006.—Ordered to be printed

Mr. LEwWIS of California, from the committee of conference,
submitted the following

CONFERENCE REPORT

[To accompany H.R. 4939]

The committee of conference on the disagreeing votes of the
two Houses on the amendment of the Senate to the bill (H.R.
4939), “making emergency supplemental appropriations for the fis-
cal year ending September 30, 2006, and for other purposes”, hav-
ing met, after full and free conference, have agreed to recommend
and do recommend to their respective Houses as follows:

That the House recede from its disagreement to the amend-
ment of the Senate and agree to the same with amendment as fol-
lows:

In lieu of the matter proposed to be inserted by the Senate
amendment, insert the following:

That the following sums are appropriated, out of any money in the
Treasury not otherwise appropriated, for the fiscal year ending Sep-
tember 30, 2006, and for other purposes, namely:

27-798



2
TITLE 1

GLOBAL WAR ON TERROR SUPPLEMENTAL
APPROPRIATIONS

CHAPTER 1
DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE

FOREIGN AGRICULTURAL SERVICE
PUBLIC LAW 480 TITLE II GRANTS

For an additional amount for “Public Law 480 Title II Grants”,
during the current fiscal year, not otherwise recoverable, and unre-
covered prior years’ costs, including interest thereon, under the Agri-
cultural Trade Development and Assistance Act of 1954, for com-
modities supplied in connection with dispositions abroad under title
II of said Act, $350,000,000, to remain available until expended:
Provided, That from this amount, to the maximum extent possible,
funding shall be used to support the previously approved fiscal year
2006 programs under section 204(a)(2) of the Agricultural Trade
Development and Assistance Act of 1954: Provided further, That the
amount provided under this heading is designated as an emergency
requirement pursuant to section 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Con-
gress), the concurrent resolution on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

CHAPTER 2
DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE—MILITARY
MILITARY PERSONNEL

MILITARY PERSONNEL, ARMY

For an additional amount for “Military Personnel, Army”,
$6,587,473,000: Provided, That the amount provided under this
heading is designated as an emergency requirement pursuant to sec-
tion 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent resolu-
tion on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

MILITARY PERSONNEL, NAVY

For an additional amount for “Military Personnel, Navy”,
$1,321,474,000: Provided, That the amount provided under this
heading is designated as an emergency requirement pursuant to sec-
tion 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent resolu-
tion on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

MILITARY PERSONNEL, MARINE CORPS

For an additional amount for “Military Personnel, Marine
Corps”, $840,872,000: Provided, That the amount provided under
this heading is designated as an emergency requirement pursuant
to section 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent
resolution on the budget for fiscal year 2006.



3

MILITARY PERSONNEL, AIR FORCE

For an additional amount for “Military Personnel, Air Force”,
$1,155,713,000: Provided, That the amount provided under this
heading is designated as an emergency requirement pursuant to sec-
tion 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent resolu-
tion on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

RESERVE PERSONNEL, ARMY

For an additional amount for “Reserve Personnel, Army”,
$140,570,000: Provided, That the amount provided under this head-
ing is designated as an emergency requirement pursuant to section
402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent resolution
on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

RESERVE PERSONNEL, NAVY

For an additional amount for “Reserve Personnel, Navy”,
$110,712,000: Provided, That the amount provided under this head-
ing is designated as an emergency requirement pursuant to section
402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent resolution
on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

RESERVE PERSONNEL, MARINE CORPS

For an additional amount for “Reserve Personnel, Marine
Corps”, $10,627,000: Provided, That the amount provided under
this heading is designated as an emergency requirement pursuant
to section 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent
resolution on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

RESERVE PERSONNEL, AIR FORCE

For an additional amount for “Reserve Personnel, Air Force”,
$1,940,000: Provided, That the amount provided under this heading
is designated as an emergency requirement pursuant to section 402
of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent resolution on
the budget for fiscal year 2006.

NATIONAL GUARD PERSONNEL, ARMY

For an additional amount for “National Guard Personnel,
Army”, $111,550,000: Provided, That the amount provided under
this heading is designated as an emergency requirement pursuant
to section 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent
resolution on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

NATIONAL GUARD PERSONNEL, AIR FORCE

For an additional amount for “National Guard Personnel, Air
Force”, $1,200,000: Provided, That the amount provided under this
heading is designated as an emergency requirement pursuant to sec-
tion 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent resolu-
tion on the budget for fiscal year 2006.



4
OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE

OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE, ARMY

For an additional amount for “Operation and Maintenance,
Army”, $17,744,410,000: Provided, That the amount provided under
this heading is designated as an emergency requirement pursuant
to section 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent
resolution on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE, NAVY

For an additional amount for “Operation and Maintenance,
Navy”, $2,696,693,000: Provided, That the amount provided under
this heading is designated as an emergency requirement pursuant
to section 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent
resolution on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE, MARINE CORPS

For an additional amount for “Operation and Maintenance,
Marine Corps”, $1,639,911,000: Provided, That the amount pro-
vided under this heading is designated as an emergency require-
ment pursuant to section 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress),
the concurrent resolution on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE, AIR FORCE

For an additional amount for “Operation and Maintenance, Air
Force”, $5,576,257,000: Provided, That the amount provided under
this heading is designated as an emergency requirement pursuant
to section 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent
resolution on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE, DEFENSE-WIDE
(INCLUDING TRANSFER OF FUNDS)

For an additional amount for “Operation and Maintenance, De-
fense-Wide”, $2,830,677,000, of which—

(1) not to exceed $25,000,000 may be used for the Combait-
ant Commander Initiative Fund, to be used in support of Oper-
ation Iraqi Freedom and Operation Enduring Freedom,;

(2) not to exceed $5,000,000 can be used for emergencies
and extraordinary expenses, to be expended on the approval or
authority of the Secretary of Defense, and payments may be
made on his certificate of necessity for confidential military
purposes;

(3) not to exceed $740,000,000, to remain available until ex-
pended, may be used for payments to reimburse Pakistan, Jor-
dan, and other key cooperating nations, for logistical, military,
and other support provided, or to be provided, to United States
military operations, notwithstanding any other provision of
law: Provided, That such payments may be made in such
amounts as the Secretary of Defense, with the concurrence of the
Secretary of State, and in consultation with the Director of the
Office of Management and Budget, may determine, in his dis-
cretion, based on documentation determined by the Secretary of



5

Defense to adequately account for the support provided, and
such determination is final and conclusive upon the accounting
officers of the United States, and 15 days following notification
to the appropriate congressional committees: Provided further,
That the Secretary of Defense shall provide quarterly reports to
the congressional defense committees on the use of funds pro-
vided in this paragraph; and
(4 up to $75,000,000 shall be transferred to the Coast
Guard “Operating Expenses” account:
Provided further, That the amount provided under this heading is
designated as an emergency requirement pursuant to section 402 of
H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent resolution on the
budget for fiscal year 2006.

OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE, ARMY RESERVE

For an additional amount for “Operation and Maintenance,
Army Reserve”, $100,100,000: Provided, That the amount provided
under this heading is designated as an emergency requirement pur-
suant to section 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concur-
rent resolution on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE, NAVY RESERVE

For an additional amount for “Operation and Maintenance,
Navy Reserve”, $78,509,000: Provided, That the amount provided
under this heading is designated as an emergency requirement pur-
suant to section 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concur-
rent resolution on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE, MARINE CORPS RESERVE

For an additional amount for “Operation and Maintenance,
Marine Corps Reserve”, $87,875,000: Provided, That the amount
provided under this heading is designated as an emergency require-
ment pursuant to section 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress),
the concurrent resolution on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE, AIR FORCE RESERVE

For an additional amount for “Operation and Maintenance, Air
Force Reserve”, $18,5663,000: Provided, That the amount provided
under this heading is designated as an emergency requirement pur-
suant to section 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concur-
rent resolution on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE, ARMY NATIONAL GUARD

For an additional amount for “Operation and Maintenance,
Army National Guard”, $178,600,000: Provided, That the amount
provided under this heading is designated as an emergency require-
ment pursuant to section 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress),
the concurrent resolution on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE, AIR NATIONAL GUARD

For an additional amount for “Operation and Maintenance, Air
National Guard”, $30,400,000: Provided, That the amount provided
under this heading is designated as an emergency requirement pur-



6

suant to section 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concur-
rent resolution on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

FORMER SoVIET UNION THREAT REDUCTION ACCOUNT

For an additional amount for “Former Soviet Union Threat Re-
duction Account”, $44,500,000: Provided, That the amount provided
under this heading is designated as an emergency requirement pur-
suant to section 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concur-
rent resolution on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

AFGHANISTAN SECURITY FORCES FUND
(INCLUDING TRANSFER OF FUNDS)

For the “Afghanistan Security Forces Fund”, $1,908,133,000, to
remain available until September 30, 2007: Provided, That such
funds shall be available to the Secretary of Defense, notwith-
standing any other provision of law, for the purpose of allowing the
Commander, Office of Security Cooperation—Afghanistan, or the
Secretary’s designee, to provide assistance, with the concurrence of
the Secretary of State, to the security forces of Afghanistan, includ-
ing the provision of equipment, supplies, services, training, facility
and infrastructure repair, renovation, and construction, and fund-
ing: Provided further, That the authority to provide assistance
under this heading is in addition to any other authority to provide
assistance to foreign nations: Provided further, That the Secretary
of Defense may transfer such funds to appropriations for military
personnel; operation and maintenance; QOverseas Humanitarian,
Disaster, and Civic Aid; procurement; research, development, test
and evaluation; and defense working capital funds to accomplish
the purposes provided herein: Provided further, That this transfer
authority is in addition to any other transfer authority available to
the Department of Defense: Provided further, That upon a deter-
mination that all or part of the funds so transferred from this ap-
propriation are not necessary for the purposes provided herein, such
amounts may be transferred back to this appropriation: Provided
further, That contributions of funds for the purposes provided here-
in from any person, foreign government, or international organiza-
tion may be credited to this Fund, and used for such purposes: Pro-
vided further, That the Secretary shall notify the congressional de-
fense committees in writing upon the receipt and upon the transfer
of any contribution delineating the sources and amounts of the
funds received and the specific use of such contributions: Provided
further, That the Secretary of Defense shall, not fewer than five days
prior to making transfers from this appropriation account, notify
the congressional defense committees in writing of the details of any
such transfer: Provided further, That the Secretary shall submit a
report no later than 30 days after the end of each fiscal quarter to
the congressional defense committees summarizing the details of the
transfer of funds from this appropriation: Provided further, That
the amount provided under this heading is designated as an emer-
gency requirement pursuant to section 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th
Congress), the concurrent resolution on the budget for fiscal year
2006.



7

IrRAQ SECURITY FORCES FUND
(INCLUDING TRANSFER OF FUNDS)

For the “Iraq Security Forces Fund”, $3,007,000,000, to remain
available until September 30, 2007: Provided, That such funds shall
be available to the Secretary of Defense, notwithstanding any other
provision of law, for the purpose of allowing the Commander, Multi-
National Security Transition Command—Iraq, or the Secretary’s
designee, to provide assistance, with the concurrence of the Sec-
retary of State, to the security forces of Iraq, including the provision
of equipment, supplies, services, training, facility and infrastructure
repair, renovation, and construction, and funding: Provided further,
That the authority to provide assistance under this heading is in
addition to any other authority to provide assistance to foreign na-
tions: Provided further, That the Secretary of Defense may transfer
such funds to appropriations for military personnel; operation and
maintenance; Overseas Humanitarian, Disaster, and Civic Aid; pro-
curement; research, development, test and evaluation; and defense
working capital funds to accomplish the purposes provided herein:
Provided further, That this transfer authority is in addition to any
other transfer authority available to the Department of Defense: Pro-
vided further, That upon a determination that all or part of the
funds so transferred from this appropriation are not necessary for
the purposes provided herein, such amounts may be transferred
back to this appropriation: Provided further, That contributions of
funds for the purposes provided herein from any person, foreign gouv-
ernment, or international organization may be credited to this
Fund, and used for such purposes: Provided further, That the Sec-
retary shall notify the congressional defense committees in writing
upon the receipt and upon the transfer of any contribution delin-
eating the sources and amounts of the funds received and the spe-
cific use of such contributions: Provided further, That the Secretary
of Defense shall, not fewer than five days prior to making transfers
from this appropriation account, notify the congressional defense
committees in writing of the details of any such transfer: Provided
further, That the Secretary shall submit a report no later than 30
days after the end of each fiscal quarter to the congressional defense
committees summarizing the details of the transfer of funds from
this appropriation: Provided further, That the amount provided
under this heading is designated as an emergency requirement pur-
suant to section 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concur-
rent resolution on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

JOINT IMPROVISED EXPLOSIVE DEVICE DEFEAT FUND
(INCLUDING TRANSFER OF FUNDS)

For the “Joint Improvised Explosive Device Defeat Fund”,
$1,958,089,000, to remain available until September 30, 2008: Pro-
vided, That such funds shall be available to the Secretary of De-
fense, notwithstanding any other provision of law, for the purpose
of allowing the Director of the Joint Improvised Explosive Device
Defeat Organization to investigate, develop and provide equipment,
supplies, services, training, facilities, personnel and funds to assist
United States forces in the defeat of improvised explosive devices:
Provided further, That within 60 days of the enactment of this Act,



8

a plan for the intended management and use of the Fund is pro-
vided to the congressional defense committees: Provided further,
That the Secretary of Defense shall submit a report not later than
30 days after the end of each fiscal quarter to the congressional de-
fense committees providing assessments of the evolving threats, indi-
vidual service requirements to counter the threats, the current strat-
egy for predeployment training of members of the Armed Forces on
improvised explosive devices, and details on the execution of this
Fund: Provided further, That the Secretary of Defense may transfer
funds provided herein to appropriations for military personnel; op-
eration and maintenance; procurement; research, development, test
and evaluation; and defense working capital funds to accomplish
the purpose provided herein: Provided further, That this transfer
authority is in addition to any other transfer authority available to
the Department of Defense: Provided further, That upon determina-
tion that all or part of the funds so transferred from this appropria-
tion are not necessary for the purpose provided herein, such
amounts may be transferred back to this appropriation: Provided
further, That the Secretary of Defense shall, not fewer than 5 days
prior to making transfers from this appropriation, notify the con-
gressional defense committees in writing of the details of any such
transfer: Provided further, That the amount provided under this
heading is designated as an emergency requirement pursuant to sec-
tion 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent resolu-
tion on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

PROCUREMENT

AIRCRAFT PROCUREMENT, ARMY

For an additional amount for “Aircraft Procurement, Army”,
$345,000,000, to remain available until September 30, 2008: Pro-
vided, That the amount provided under this heading is designated
as an emergency requirement pursuant to section 402 of H. Con.
Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent resolution on the budget
for fiscal year 2006.

MISSILE PROCUREMENT, ARMY

For an additional amount for “Missile Procurement, Army”,
$203,300,000, to remain available until September 30, 2008: Pro-
vided, That the amount provided under this heading is designated
as an emergency requirement pursuant to section 402 of H. Con.
Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent resolution on the budget
for fiscal year 2006.

PROCUREMENT OF WEAPONS AND TRACKED COMBAT VEHICLES,
ARMY

For an additional amount for “Procurement of Weapons and
Tracked Combat Vehicles, Army”, $1,767,451,000, to remain avail-
able until September 30, 2008: Provided, That the amount provided
under this heading is designated as an emergency requirement pur-
suant to section 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concur-
rent resolution on the budget for fiscal year 2006.



9

PROCUREMENT OF AMMUNITION, ARMY

For an additional amount for “Procurement of Ammunition,
Army”, $829,679,000, to remain available until September 30, 2008:
Provided, That the amount provided under this heading is des-
ignated as an emergency requirement pursuant to section 402 of H.
Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent resolution on the
budget for fiscal year 2006.

OTHER PROCUREMENT, ARMY

For an additional amount for “Other Procurement, Army”,
$5,819,645,000, to remain available until September 30, 2008: Pro-
vided, That the amount provided under this heading is designated
as an emergency requirement pursuant to section 402 of H. Con.
Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent resolution on the budget
for fiscal year 2006.

AIRCRAFT PROCUREMENT, NAVY

For an additional amount for “Aircraft Procurement, Navy”,
$516,869,000, to remain available until September 30, 2008: Pro-
vided, That the amount provided under this heading is designated
as an emergency requirement pursuant to section 402 of H. Con.
Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent resolution on the budget
for fiscal year 2006.

WEAPONS PROCUREMENT, NAVY

For an additional amount for “Weapons Procurement, Navy”,
$55,200,000, to remain available until September 30, 2008: Pro-
vided, That the amount provided under this heading is designated
as an emergency requirement pursuant to section 402 of H. Con.
Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent resolution on the budget
for fiscal year 2006.

PROCUREMENT OF AMMUNITION, NAVY AND MARINE CORPS

For an additional amount for “Procurement of Ammunition,
Navy and Marine Corps”, $323,256,000, to remain available until
September 30, 2008: Provided, That the amount provided under this
heading is designated as an emergency requirement pursuant to sec-
tion 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent resolu-
tion on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

OTHER PROCUREMENT, NAVY

For an additional amount for “Other Procurement, Navy”,
$54,640,000, to remain available until September 30, 2008: Pro-
vided, That the amount provided under this heading is designated
as an emergency requirement pursuant to section 402 of H. Con.
Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent resolution on the budget
for fiscal year 2006.

PROCUREMENT, MARINE CORPS

For an additional amount for “Procurement, Marine Corps”,
$2,677,467,000, to remain available until September 30, 2008: Pro-
vided, That the amount provided under this heading is designated



10

as an emergency requirement pursuant to section 402 of H. Con.
Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent resolution on the budget
for fiscal year 2006.

AIRCRAFT PROCUREMENT, AIR FORCE

For an additional amount for “Aircraft Procurement, Air
Force”, $674,815,000, to remain available until September 30, 2008:
Provided, That the amount provided under this heading is des-
ignated as an emergency requirement pursuant to section 402 of H.
Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent resolution on the
budget for fiscal year 2006.

PROCUREMENT OF AMMUNITION, AIR FORCE

For an additional amount for “Procurement of Ammunition, Air
Force”, $29,047,000, to remain available until September 30, 2008:
Provided, That the amount provided under this heading is des-
ignated as an emergency requirement pursuant to section 402 of H.
Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent resolution on the
budget for fiscal year 2006.

OTHER PROCUREMENT, AIR FORCE

For an additional amount for “Other Procurement, Air Force”,
$1,500,591,000, to remain available until September 30, 2008: Pro-
vided, That the amount provided under this heading is designated
as an emergency requirement pursuant to section 402 of H. Con.
Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent resolution on the budget
for fiscal year 2006.

PROCUREMENT, DEFENSE-WIDE

For an additional amount for “Procurement, Defense-Wide”,
$331,353,000, to remain available until September 30, 2008: Pro-
vided, That the amount provided under this heading is designated
as an emergency requirement pursuant to section 402 of H. Con.
Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent resolution on the budget
for fiscal year 2006.

RESEARCH, DEVELOPMENT, TEST AND EVALUATION

RESEARCH, DEVELOPMENT, TEST AND EVALUATION, ARMY

For an additional amount for “Research, Development, Test and
Evaluation, Army”, $54,700,000, to remain available until Sep-
tember 30, 2007: Provided, That the amount provided under this
heading is designated as an emergency requirement pursuant to sec-
tion 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent resolu-
tion on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

RESEARCH, DEVELOPMENT, TEST AND EVALUATION, NAVY

For an additional amount for “Research, Development, Test and
Evaluation, Navy”, $124,845,000, to remain available until Sep-
tember 30, 2007: Provided, That the amount provided under this
heading is designated as an emergency requirement pursuant to sec-
tion 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent resolu-
tion on the budget for fiscal year 2006.



11

RESEARCH, DEVELOPMENT, TEST AND EVALUATION, AIR FORCE

For an additional amount for “Research, Development, Test and
Evaluation, Air Force”, $382,630,000, to remain available until Sep-
tember 30, 2007: Provided, That the amount provided under this
heading is designated as an emergency requirement pursuant to sec-
tion 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent resolu-
tion on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

RESEARCH, DEVELOPMENT, TEST AND EVALUATION, DEFENSE-WIDE

For an additional amount for “Research, Development, Test and
Evaluation, Defense-Wide”, $148,5651,000, to remain available until
September 30, 2007: Provided, That the amount provided under this
heading is designated as an emergency requirement pursuant to sec-
tion 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent resolu-
tion on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

REVOLVING AND MANAGEMENT FUNDS

DEFENSE WORKING CAPITAL FUNDS

For an additional amount for “Defense Working Capital
Funds”, $516,700,000: Provided, That the amount provided under
this heading is designated as an emergency requirement pursuant
to section 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent
resolution on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

OTHER DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE PROGRAMS

DEFENSE HEALTH PROGRAM

For an additional amount for “Defense Health Program”,
$1,153,562,000 for operation and maintenance: Provided, That the
amount provided under this heading is designated as an emergency
requirement pursuant to section 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Con-
gress), the concurrent resolution on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

DRUG INTERDICTION AND COUNTER-DRUG ACTIVITIES, DEFENSE
(INCLUDING TRANSFER OF FUNDS)

For an additional amount for “Drug Interdiction and Counter-
Drug Activities, Defense”, $150,470,000, to remain available until
expended: Provided, That these funds may be used only for such ac-
tivities related to Afghanistan and the Central Asia area: Provided
further, That the Secretary of Defense may transfer such funds only
to appropriations for military personnel; operation and mainte-
nance; procurement, and research, development, test and evaluation:
Provided further, That the funds transferred shall be merged with
and be available for the same purposes and for the same time pe-
riod as the appropriation to which transferred: Provided further,
That the transfer authority provided in this paragraph is in addi-
tion to any other transfer authority available to the Department of
Defense: Provided further, That upon a determination that all or
part of the funds transferred from this appropriation are not nec-
essary for the purposes provided herein, such amounts may be
transferred back to this appropriation: Provided further, That the
amount provided under this heading is designated as an emergency



12

requirement pursuant to section 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Con-
gress), the concurrent resolution on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

OFFICE OF THE INSPECTOR GENERAL

For an additional amount for “Office of the Inspector General”,
$5,000,000, to remain available until September 30, 2007: Provided,
That the amount provided under this heading is designated as an
emergency requirement pursuant to section 402 of H. Con. Res. 95
(109th Congress), the concurrent resolution on the budget for fiscal
year 2006.

RELATED AGENCIES

INTELLIGENCE COMMUNITY MANAGEMENT ACCOUNT

For an additional amount for the “Intelligence Community
Management Account”, $158,875,000: Provided, That the amount
provided under this heading is designated as an emergency require-
ment pursuant to section 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress),
the concurrent resolution on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

GENERAL PROVISIONS—THIS CHAPTER
(TRANSFER OF FUNDS)

SEc. 1201. Upon his determination that such action is nec-
essary in the national interest, the Secretary of Defense may transfer
between appropriations up to $2,000,000,000 of the funds made
available to the Department of Defense in this chapter: Provided,
That the Secretary shall notify the Congress promptly of each trans-
fer made pursuant to this authority: Provided further, That the
transfer authority provided in this section is in addition to any
other transfer authority available to the Department of Defense: Pro-
vided further, That the authority in this section is subject to the
same terms and conditions as the authority provided in section 8005
of the Department of Defense Appropriations Act, 2006, except for
the fourth prouviso.

(TRANSFER OF FUNDS)

SEC. 1202. Section 8005 of the Department of Defense Appro-
priations Act, 2006, (Public Law 109-148; 119 Stat. 2680), is
amended by striking “$3,750,000,000”  and inserting
“$5,000,000,000”: Provided, That funds previously transferred
among appropriations under the authority of section 8005 of Public
Law 109-148 pursuant to reprogramming action 06-13PA may be
restored to their source appropriations accounts: Provided further,
That transfers made pursuant to reprogramming action 06-13PA
and transfers back under this section shall not be taken into ac-
count for purposes of the limitation on the amount of funds that
may be transferred under section 8005: Provided further, That the
amount made available by the transfer of funds in or pursuant to
this section is designated as an emergency requirement pursuant to
section 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the concurrent reso-
lution on the budget for fiscal year 2006.



13

(TRANSFER OF FUNDS)

SEc. 1203. During fiscal year 2006 and from funds in the De-
fense Cooperation Account, the Secretary of Defense may transfer
not to exceed $5,800,000 to such appropriations or funds of the De-
partment of Defense as he shall determine for use consistent with
the purposes for which such funds were contributed and accepted:
Provided, That such amounts shall be available for the same time
period as the appropriation to which transferred: Provided further,
That the amount made available by the transfer of funds in or pur-
suant to this section is designated as an emergency requirement
pursuant to section 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress), the
concurrent resolution on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

SEC. 1204. Section 1005(c)(2) of the National Defense Author-
ization Act, Fiscal Year 2006 (Public Law 109-163) is amended by
striking “$289,447,000” and inserting “$345,547,000”.

SEc. 1205. (a) AUTHORITY TO PROVIDE SUPPORT.—Of the
amount appropriated by this Act under the heading, “Drug Interdic-
tion and Counter-Drug Activities, Defense”, not to exceed
$22,200,000 may be made available for support for counter-drug ac-
tivities of the Governments of Afghanistan and Pakistan: Provided,
That such support shall be in addition to support provided for the
counter-drug activities of such Governments under any other provi-
sion of the law.

(b) TYPES OF SUPPORT.—

(1) Except as specified in subsections (b)(2) and (b)(3) of
this section, the support that may be provided under the author-
ity in this section shall be limited to the types of support speci-
fied in section 1033(c)(1) of the National Defense Authorization
Act for Fiscal Year 1998 (Public Law 105-85, as amended by
Public Law 106-398 and Public Law 108—-136), and conditions
on the provision of support as contained in section 1033 shall
apply for fiscal year 2006.

(2) The Secretary of Defense may transfer vehicles, aircraft,
and detection, interception, monitoring and testing equipment
to said Governments for counter-drug activities.

(3) For the Government of Afghanistan, the Secretary of De-
fense may also provide individual and crew-served weapons,
and ammunition for counter-drug security forces.

SEc. 1206. Notwithstanding 10 U.S.C. 2208(1), the total amount
of advance billings rendered or imposed for all working capital
funds of the Department of Defense in fiscal year 2006 shall not ex-
ceed $1,200,000,000: Provided, That the amounts made available
pursuant to this section are designated as an emergency require-
ment pursuant to section 402 of H. Con. Res. 95 (109th Congress),
the concurrent resolution on the budget for fiscal year 2006.

SEc. 1207. In addition to amounts authorized in section
1202(a) of Public Law 109-163, from funds made available in this
chapter to the Department of Defense, not to exceed $423,000,000
may be used to fund the Commander’s Emergency Response Pro-
gram and for a similar program to assist the people of Afghanistan,
to remain available until December 31, 2007.

SEc. 1208. Supervision and administration costs associated
with a construction project funded with “Afghanistan Security
Forces Fund” or “Iraq Security Forces Fund” appropriations may be



14

obligated at the time a construction contract is awarded: Provided,
That for the purpose of this section, supervision and administration
costs include all in-house Government costs.

SEC. 1209. None of the funds provided in this chapter may be
used to finance programs or activities denied by Congress in fiscal
year 2005 and 2006 appropriations to the Department of Defense or
to initiate a procurement or research, development, test and evalua-
tion new start program without prior written notification to the con-
gressional defense committees.

SEc. 1210. Effective as of January 6, 2006, and as if included
in the enactment of the National Defense Authorization Act for Fis-
cal Year 2006 (Public Law 109-163), subsection (d)(2) of section
1478 of title 10, United States Code, as added by section 664(b) of
such Act (119 Stat. 3316), is amended by striking “May 11, 2005”
and inserting “August 31, 2005”.

(RESCISSIONS)

SEc. 1211. Of the funds appropriated in Department of Defense
Appropriations Acts, the following funds are hereby rescinded from
the following accounts and programs in the specified amounts:

“Missile Procurement, Air Force, 2006/2008”, $80,000,000;

“Other Procurement, Air Force, 2005 /20077, $39,400,000.
SEc. 1212. (a) SENSE OF CONGRESS.—Congress recognizes the

importance of ensuring that absent uniformed services voters, De-
partment of Defense personnel, and their dependents have the op-
portunity to exercise their right to vote.

(b) IVAS BALLOT REQUEST PROGRAM.—

(1) The Interim Voting Assistance System (IVAS) Ballot Re-
quest Program shall be continued with respect to all absent uni-
formed services voters, Department of Defense personnel, and
dependents covered by the Uniformed and Overseas Citizens
Absentee Voting Act (42 U.S.C. 1973ff et seq.) with the objective
to further improve ballot request procedures and voting assist-
ance with respect to such persons.

(2) Not later than 90 days after the date of the enactment
of this Act, the Secretary of Defense shall submit to the congres-
sional defense committees a report on the status of the program
referred to in paragraph (1), including an accounting of the uti-
lization of funds available for the program under subsection (c).
(¢) FUNDING.—Of the amounts provided by this chapter,

$2,500,000 shall be available for the program referred to in sub-
section (b).

SEc. 1213. (a) FINDINGS.—The Senate makes the following find-
ings:

(1) Title IX of the Department of Defense Appropriations
Act, 2006 (division A of Public Law 109-148) appropriated
$50,000,000,000 for the cost of ongoing military operations over-
seas in fisca